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Graphic Scale
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Note: Project overlap with wetland areas, rights of way and property lines is approximate and needs confirmation with a site survey

ALTERNATIVE 1: GRAY
ACCESS POINT 

W/DEPLOYABLE BARRIER

REBUILT REVETMENT 
W/2:1 SLOPE

ELEV: 11.5’

ELEV: 11.5’

A parapet wall to 11.5 feet 
and a rebuilt revetment along 
the Mayo Creek crossing �e 
in to a high point near Mac’s 
on the Pier. Sliding gates or 
deployable barriers are 
necessary at the parking lot 
and dock to allow for entry 
and exit. Connec�ons to the 
alterna�ve selected for 
Kendrick Avenue must be 
considered.

EXISTING CULVERT 
W/TIDE FLAP
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ALTERNATIVE 2: HYBRID

ELEV 10.3’ 6’ X 7’ BOX 
CULVERT

1079 linear feet of road are 
elevated to 10.3 feet with 3:1 
side slopes. A 6’ x 7’ box 
culvert and operable �de 
gate are installed at the 
crossing of Mayo Creek, 
consistent with 
recommenda�ons from an 
exis�ng project. Connec�ons 
to the alterna�ve selected for 
Kendrick Avenue must be 
considered.






	Wellfleet_CS_GrayPlan-01
	Wellfleet_CS_HybridPlan-01
	Wellfleet_CS_Sections-01
	Wellfleet_CS_GrayPlan
	Wellfleet_CS_Sections-02
	Wellfleet_CS_HybridPlan
	Wellfleet_CS_Sections-03
	Wellfleet_CS_Summary-03

