Jeffrey Ribeiro

From: Kevin Eriksen <keriksen@raventures.net>
Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2015 12:42 PM

To: Jonathon Idman; Jeffrey Ribeiro

Cc: Katherine A. Cruz

Subject: RE: Springhill Suites DRI Fee

Thank you gentlemen. It is not often that | like to admit when | am wrong, but in this instance, | strangely feel ok about
it. I will mail the new check today. Shall | sent it to the following:

Jeffrey Ribeiro

Regulatory Officer Il

Cape Cod Commission

3225 Main Street, PO Box 226
Barnstable, MA 02630

(508) 744-1210

Kevin S. Eriksen
General Counsel

Ryan Development, LLC
2 Lan Drive

Westford, MA 01886
Tel: (978) 692-9450
Fax: (978) 692-4424

This e-mail and any attachments are only intended for the person(s) or entity to whom or which it is addressed and may contain
information which is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure or any type of use under applicable law. If you have
received this e-mail in error, please notify us immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message from your system. You are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, other use of this e-mail is strictly prohibited

From: Jonathon ldman [mailto:jidman@capecodcommission.org]
Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2015 12:39 PM

To: Jeffrey Ribeiro; Kevin Eriksen

Cc: Katherine A. Cruz

Subject: RE: Springhill Suites DRI Fee

...and stating what is probably the obvious (which is one of my strong suits), please send a check for review fees to us in
the amount of $7689 as we are returning the overfunded check to you per Jeff’s email below. Thanks. Jon Idman.

From: Jeffrey Ribeiro

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2015 12:35 PM
To: 'Kevin Eriksen'

Cc: Katherine A. Cruz; Jonathon Idman
Subject: Springhill Suites DRI Fee

Kevin,



Thanks for sending over the paper application materials. We received them, including the check, today. | have some
good news for you on that front.

I’'m not sure how exactly you calculated the fee, but by our account it should be substantially less.
For non-residential DRIs:

$0.53 per square foot x 65,000 square feet = $34,450

Because the Limited DRI decision reduced review to a single issue area:

34,450 x 30% = $10,335

With credit for your Limited Review filing fee:

10,335 - 2646 = $7689

Please feel free to give me a call if you have any questions. I'm out of the office tomorrow, but otherwise | should be at
my desk. Also, | will put the check in the mail back to you.

Best,
Jeffrey

Jeffrey Ribeiro

Regulatory Officer Il

Cape Cod Commission

3225 Main Street, PO Box 226
Barnstable, MA 02630

(508) 744-1210



